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Chi huahua pup ‐
pies 8 weeks old-
1 male blue short
hair-500.00/1 fe ‐
male black long
hair -600.00-1st

shots given.
Friendly and very
playful. Call 483-

7258.

  Anigua 158 Bradley Pl.
Gray hse bhnd Flamingo
Saturday ONLY @630

Multi-Family 

WANTED TO BUY :

Finally, seller financing
available! Low dp. Yona
land. 60k. Call 687 6239.

PPM Brk 

Guam Memorial Hospital Authority 

Aturidåt Espetåt Mimuriåt Guåhan 

850 Gov. Carlos G. Camacho Rd. 

Tamuning, Guam 96913

INVITATION FOR BID
GMHA IFB No. 014-2021 Removal and Replacement of Air Handling Units in Various Areas

IFB 2021 Submission Due: 08:30 a.m. CST, Monday, October 18, 2021 in the 
                                 Materials Management Department

Opening Time: 09:00 a.m. CST, Monday, October 18, 2021 in the GMHA Daniel 

       Webb Conference Room

**A Site Visit for assessment is scheduled for 10:00 a.m. on Wednesday, October 06, 2021 
at the Guam Memorial Hospital. All Covid-19 precautions must be followed. All bidders are 
requested to be present. All questions must be submitted in writing no later than 
Monday, October 11, 2021 at 4:00 p.m. CST. 
All bids bids be sealed, submitted in duplicate and received by the Materials Management 
Department by the due date of October 18, 2021 at 8:30 am. CST. Bidding docu ments are 
available until the submission date at the same department for a non-refundable fee of 
$20.00 per set, or can be downloaded from the GMHA website. Funding is made available via 
Office of the Honorable Governor of Guam and the U.S. Department of Interior, Office of Insular 

Affairs, Grant/Cooperative Agreement No. D15AP00046, Pro ject Title. Guam-CIP-2015-5. 
All interested firms must register with the GMHA Materials Management Department to 
participate in the bid. Please call (671) 647-2165 to register, or register online at www.gmha.
org. Registration is required to ensure all Amendments or Notices are communicated to all 
bidders throughout the bid process. GMHA shall not be liable for failure to provide notice to 
any party that did not register contact information with GMHA.

For more information, please visit our public information page at www.gmha.org.

/s/ Lillian Perez-Posadas RN, MN

Hospital Administrator/CEO

This advertisement was paid for with GMHA Operational Funds.

PA CIFIC COAST

REAL ES TATE

&

DE VEL OP MENT

Look ing to Buy Rent or
Sale? Check us out!

Great prop erty val ues
and in vest ments for all
your real es tate needs

FOR RENT

Apart ments / Con dos /
Homes / Com mer cial

Space

FOR SALE

Res i den tial Homes /
Va cant Land /
Com mer cial

MIL I TARY RENTALS

PROP ERTY
MAN AGE MENT

Call:(671) 688-9463
Of fice (671)734-4852

Email:
dm paci fic coast718@ 

gmail. com

Board of Commissioners Meeting
Friday, October 08, 2021 at 12:00 PM.

This meeting is open to the public via Zoom.

Topic: GHURA BOC Mtg. October 8, 2021 12PM
Time: Oct 8, 2021 12:00 PM Guam, Port Moresby

Join Zoom Meeting 
https://us06web.zoom.us/j/83649516621?pwd=ck9LZ
S9BeWM0cHhoRE5kNHlnTjNYZz09

Meeting ID: 836 4951 6621  ID Passcode: 617891

AGENDA:
 I. ROLL CALL 
 II.  BOARD MEETING PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENTS
 III.  APPROVAL OF PREVIOUS BOARD MINUTES 
  – September 24, 2021
 IV.  NEW BUSINESS
  1. Resolution approving the Above-Step 
  Recruitment for the Accountant II position
  2. Intent of Award for IFB#GHURA-COCC-
  021-010; IT Equipment
 V.  CORRESPONDENCE AND REPORTS
  1. A/E Manager’s Update
 VI.  GENERAL DISCUSSION/ANNOUNCEMENTS
  1. Next proposed scheduled Board 
  Meeting – Friday, October 22, 2021 
 VII.  ADJOURNMENT. 

The full agenda may be viewed on our website at www.ghura.org.

For more information, please contact Audrey Aguon at 475-1378 and 
for special accommodations, please contact Chief Planner - Designated 
Section 504 / ADA Coordinator at 475-1322 or TTY 472-3701.

This advertisement was paid for by GHURA.

THE GUAM HOUSING AND 
URBAN RENEWAL AUTHORITY

Turn here for
your next vehicle

Discover your
new home

Find a new job
or career

Household,Jobs
Homes

Rentals
& Auto

CLASSIFIEDS

Pets &
Furniture,

Place an ad online TODAY!

Guampdn.com/Classifieds
Or call (671)472-1PDN (1736)

PDN LobbyHours: Monday–Friday 8am–5pm
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NEW ORLEANS 
(AP) — Saints coach 
Sean Payton generally 
doesn’t like to dwell on 
losses.

A new week brings 

a new game, new 
matchups and a new 
scheme that may em-
phasize some players 
and de-emphasize 
others relative to the 

previous week.
But on Monday, the 

Saints’ fourth-quarter 
collapse against the 
previous winless New 
York Giants in a 27-21 
overtime loss was still 
bothering New Orle-
ans’ longtime coach.

“That game’s over, 
but we’ve got to learn 
from it,” Payton 
stressed.

The Saints (2-2), 
now in their first sea-
son since the retire-
ment of record-setting 
quarterback Drew 
Brees, appeared on 
their way to being 3-1 
and tied atop the NFC 
South, which they’ve 
won the past four sea-
sons.

Instead, Payton was 
left hinting at an ap-
parent loss of focus 
and intensity in the 
fourth quarter against 
the Giants, whose de-
fense suddenly forced 

the Saints to punt after 
just three plays after 
New Orleans had tak-
en possession, up by 
11, with about nine 
minutes remaining.

Before that series, 
the Saints had crossed 
midfield on their pre-
vious seven posses-
sions, scoring three 
touchdowns.

“It comes down to 

having pride in having 
the ball at the end of 
the game and having 
the determination to 
going to get those few 
first downs we needed 
to put the game away,” 
offensive lineman Cal-
vin Throckmorton 
said. 

Meanwhile, the Gi-
ants’ offense began 
moving the ball at 
will, scoring a touch-
down with a 2-point 
conversion and a ty-
ing field goal on suc-
cessive possessions to 
close regulation and 
force the extra period. 
After the winning the 
coin toss, New York 
methodically marched 
for a winning touch-
down against a Saints 
defense that looked 
helpless to stop them 
after having held New 
York to just 10 points 
for three-and-a-half 
quarters.

NEW YORK (AP) 
— New York Jets safe-
ty Marcus Maye has 
been charged with 
drunken driving after 
a car crash in Florida 
in February.

Broward County 
court records show 
the 28-year-old Maye 
was charged with 
three misdemeanors 
— driving under the 
influence, DUI/dam-
age to property, and 
leaving the scene of 
an accident — on Feb. 
22 in Fort Lauder-
dale, Florida. A Zoom 

hearing is scheduled 
for Oct. 20 in the case.

ESPN first reported 
the crash and charges 
Monday night.

Maye is also facing 
a civil lawsuit “in ex-
cess” of $30,000 filed 
by the driver of the car 
he hit, according to 
court documents.

According to a po-
lice report, Maye was 
driving in a black 
2018 Mercedes SUV 
on Florida’s Turnpike 
at 7:33 p.m. when the 
vehicle hit the left 
rear of a Volvo. Police 
found Maye alone in 
the driver’s seat on the 
side of the road, and 
his car had damage 
to the front that was 
consistent with the 
damage to the back of 

the Volvo.
The police officer 

wrote in the report 
that Maye was “un-
responsive when ap-
proached and mov-
ing side to side” and 
“seemed unaware of 

what was occurring.” 
The officer also wrote 
that Maye’s eyes ap-
peared bloodshot, his 
speech was slurred 
and vomit was ob-
served on the driver’s 
door and on the floor. 

Maye also was “slow 
to walk and had a 
sway to his balance,” 
the officer wrote.

The report says 
Maye told the officer 
he wasn’t drinking 
that night and said 

the smell the officer 
noticed was from two 
days earlier. Maye de-
clined to provided a 
breath sample and was 
arrested. He posted 
bond in the amount 
of $1,500. The court 
documents say it was 
Maye’s first DUI of-
fense.

There were no inju-
ries reported, but the 
driver of the Volvo, 
Jamila Abraham of 
Belle Glade, Florida, 
filed a civil suit.

The scORe

Jets’ Maye facing DUI charge after crash
AP FILE PHOTO

in this sept. 27, 2020, 

file photo, New York Jets 

safety Marcus Maye (20) 

warms up on the field be-

fore an NFL football game 

against the Indianapolis 

Colts in Indianapolis.

Saints’ coach Payton wants lessons to stick

AP PHOTO

New Orleans Saints head 

coach Sean Payton talks to 

side judge Walt Coleman 

IV (87) in the first half of an 

NFL football game against 

the New York Giants in 

New Orleans, Oct. 3.

Board of Commissioners Meeting
Friday, October 08, 2021 at 12:00 PM.

This meeting is open to the public via Zoom.
Topic: GHURA BOC Mtg. October 8, 2021 12PM

Time: Oct 8, 2021 12:00 PM Guam, Port Moresby

Join Zoom Meeting 
https://us06web.zoom.us/j/83649516621?pwd=ck9LZS9B
eWM0cHhoRE5kNHlnTjNYZz09

Meeting ID: 836 4951 6621  ID Passcode: 617891

AGENDA:
 I. ROLL CALL 
 II.  BOARD MEETING PUBLIC ANNOUNCEMENTS
 III.  APPROVAL OF PREVIOUS BOARD MINUTES 
  – September 24, 2021
 IV.  NEW BUSINESS
  1. Resolution approving the Above-Step 
  Recruitment for the Accountant II position
  2. Intent of Award for IFB#GHURA-COCC-
  021-010; IT Equipment
 V.  CORRESPONDENCE AND REPORTS
  1. A/E Manager’s Update
 VI.  GENERAL DISCUSSION/ANNOUNCEMENTS
  1. Presentation of Resolution No. FY2021-024 to 
  Sabino P. Flores
  2. Next proposed scheduled Board 
  Meeting – Friday, October 22, 2021 

 VII.  ADJOURNMENT. 

The full agenda may be viewed on our website at www.ghura.org.

For more information, please contact Audrey Aguon at 475-1378 and for 
special accommodations, please contact Chief Planner - Designated Section 
504 / ADA Coordinator at 475-1322 or TTY 472-3701.

This advertisement was paid for by GHURA.

THE GUAM HOUSING AND 
URBAN RENEWAL AUTHORITY

CAMACHO CALVO LAW GROUP 
LLC
VINCENT C. CAMACHO 
vcamacho@camachocalvo.law
356 E. Marine Corps Drive, 
Suite 201 
Hagåtña, Guam 96910
Telephone No. 671.472.6813 
Facsimile No. 671.477.4375

Attorneys for Petitioner
ENRICO A. CRISTOBAL

IN THE SUPERIOR COURT 

OF GUAM

IN THE MATTER OF 

THE ESTATE 

OF

BEATRIZ CASTRO CRISTOBAL,

Decedent.

PROBATE CASE NO.

PR0162-21

NOTICE OF HEARING

ON PETITION

1. NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN 
that Enrico A. Cristobal has filed 
a Petition for Probate of Will and 

For Letters of Administration 
with Will Annexed, reference to 

such petition is hereby made for 
further particulars.

2. A hearing on the petition 
will be heard by online remote 

appearance on Thursday, 
October 14, 2021 at 9:15 a.m. 
before the Honorable Dana A. 
Gutierrez in the Superior Court 

of Guam.
3. To attend or to participate in 

the hearing, go to: 
https://guamcourts-org.zoom.
us; and enter the Meeting ID: 

839 7874 0380 and Passcode: 
189701;or you may call into the 
courtroom at 671-475-3207, at 
your designated hearing time. 

For connectivity issues, you may 
call the courtroom or email 
jcerteza@guamcourts.org.

Date: 9/14/2021

DANIELLE T. ROSETE
Clerk of Court

/s/ JOSETTE A.B. CERTEZA
Deputy Clerk





















GUAM HOUSING AND URBAN RENEWAL AUTHOMTY
ATUMDAT GINIMA VAN RINUEBAN SIUDAT

MEMORANDUM

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT:

Board of Conmiissioners ^^^ /| _ ^^

Ray Topasna, Executive Director

Intent of Award for IFB#GHURA-COCC-021-010 IT Equipment
Desktop Computers, Laptop Computers, Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS),
Servers, Impact Printers, Laser Printers and AIO Color Laser Printers

GHURA issued an Invitation for Bid (IFB) for Desktop Computers, Laptop Computers, Unintermptible
Power Supply (UPS), Servers, Impact Printers, Laser Printers and AIO Color Laser Printers on
September 9,2021. A total of eight vendors expressed interest in the bid. The IFB closed on September
30, 2021 and seven companies submitted bids. Below are the results of the bid submissions:

Soft Pacific
Sanford

Technology
DMR PDS COMPacific Megabyte SBS Guam

Bid Item #1 $ 48,999.72 $ 27,432.24 $31,680.00 $ 26,224.00 $ 43,406.00 $ 39,264.28 no bid
Bid Item #2 $ 17,531.64 no bid no bid $ 11,400.00 $ 19,092.00 $ 17,592.00 no bid
Bid Item #3 $ 5,415.20 no bid no bid $ 2,364.00 $ 4,726.00 no bid no bid
Bid Item #4 $ 3,345.52 $ 2,830.30 no bid $ 3,563.45 $ 3,534.00 $ 4,012.64 no bid
Bid Item #5 $ 8,644.86 no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 8,091.00 no bid
Bid Item #6 $ 6,194.52 no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 1,992.00 $ 5,600.00
Bid Item #7 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $ 618.00 $ 2,970.00
Bid Item #8 $ 492.55 $ 509.32 no bid $ 429.00 $ 574.00 $ 528.00 no bid
Bid Item #9 $ 3,810.18 $ 2,863.49 no bid $ 3,300.00 $ 4,743.00 $ 3,588.00 no bid
Bid Item #10 $110,515.70 $ 42,786.25 $ 38,530.00 $ 61,175.00 $ 74,365.00 no bid no bid

Bid Item #1: (22) Desktop Computer (Tiny)
Bid Item #2: (4) Desktop Computer (Mid Tower)
Bid Item #3: (2) Laptop Computer (15.6 in.)
Bid Item #4: (31) Uninterruptible Power Supply (UPS)
Bid Item #5: (9) Black and White Laser Printer
Bid Item #6: (4) Multifunction Color Laser Printer
Bid Item #7: (1) Multifunction Color Laser Printer
Bid Item #8: (1) Impact Printer
Bid Item #9: (1) Impact Printer
Bid Item #10: (5) Rack Mount Server

Upon MIS Division's review of the bid submissions, the following were noted:
For Bid Item #2: PDS, Soft Pacific, and Megabyte were non-responsive in meeting the required
technical specifications for the mid tower desktop computers.
For Bid Item #7: Megabyte was non-responsive in meeting the required minimum specifications
for the multifunction color laser printer.

•



Therefore, GHURA is requesting for the Board of Commissioners to approve an award to the following
bidders:

Bidder Award Amoimt
Bid Item #1 | Pacific Data Systems $ 26,224.00
Bid Item #2 [ Net Circuit dba COMPacific | $ 19,092.00
Bid Item #3 | Pacific Data Systems $ 2,364.00
Bid Item #4 [ Sanford Technology $ 2,830.30
Bid Item #5 | Megabyte $ 8,091.00
Bid Item #6 [ Megabyte $ 1,992.00
Bid Item #7 SBS Guam $ 2,970.00
Bid Item #8 | Pacific Data Systems $ 429.00
Bid Item #9 | Sanford Technology $ 2,863.49
Bid Item #10 | Data Management Resources | $ 38,530.00

Total I $105,385.79

Attachment: Bid Tabulation

At the Regular of October 08, 2021, a motion was by Commissioner Ishizaki
and by Commissioner Delia to approve the intent of Award of JFB#GHURA-COCC-021-
010 for IT Equipment for Bid item #1 to Data Systems for $26,224.00, Bid Item #2 to Net
Circuit dba for $19,092.00, Bid Item #3 to Data for $2,364.00, Bid Item
#4 to Technology for $2,830.30, Bid Item #5 to for $8,091.00, Bid Item #6 to
for Bid Item #7 to SBS Guam for Bid Item #8 to Pacific Data
for $429.00, Bid Item #9 to Sanford Technology for $2,863.49, and for Bid Item #10 to
Management Resources for $38,530.00, for the grand total of $105,385.79. Without any
further discussion and objection, the motion was approved.



I

I

1§1
ill

^

I
ll

I
ll

1^1

ffl

Slsl
SlIfilli
lit
§i
o|"|

M.
Mill
111111

!
i
s'

h.

<n

i

w>

•»

n

M

g

&

i

^

s
\s\

(d
0
-3

\t3\

:1^1
fa|

~2-\

~^1
ul

^1

1-7]
t-11

"31
sl
^-1

\A|

c:''
0

^

^\
u,

oj

1'51

^IT^I
».|co|

^lj?l
•2]-S|

5|
1^1

-tefl

.;1
vtl

a(|
t:
<*1

ex I

-i, ''>! ^ ^
~^ ^>

-SJI
^1
I

s|

r^

s]

r>
<r"
<A

-rfl

K
0
3.

^
0
3-'

Sl

o?i
0

^1

0

0
rl
<r
<ri

0

s
J

Ai.

tfl

s'

"̂nl

f>i

0

7-1

s
s

•W>|

j
t

1
^ ^ r^ ^> [^»

^

I
si
0
<J

sl

?J
?1

s
I->

s

-0
>1
r-

81

s
^i

31
tal

0
'•il

"S1
tS\

0
-2

t0'
01

•2]

2.1

^
31

9\
r-l

>'?!

•3.1
^lj
>^1
s\
d

(?
u^ ?1

t3
c>

-s^1'^!^>\ ~> '>!"••

v^
(^
R>-

•sl

^1
tJ

2
y

t-^i

^

sl

-)1

tS]
0

^1
tBI

0

~i\

-31

K>|
0)?^

-I
01

IS\\
r

*°
<s<

3|
t^

-^1
il
t.^1

r^ <> 1^>

d
5:
p

§

if

-^1

6\
01
•2|

-d]
&3|
oj
21

-^?1
K>|fc2|

^Is

-tf
C£i

0

-31
ca|
<0

2.1

-^~v\
BfljCOJ

;-.»

^.1-2.

f9

0

!?>!
ll»l
If

,1
•0|
M
T]
r-

<~<

^1
u

Jl
'.-I
il̂

"> ~>1 '>ra

I
-d

I

•rl
t'^1

-r\

!sl
^1
f3

3.

(£•
^3
-.1

01
t^l
0
t^

^

*^1
1^1
<3|
^1

-31

21

°̂1<3;
z\S,

51

a»l

c^|

^1

?1 i)

0
<5|
^

(I
.?|
^bl

cii^
^cl

Jl
r>^!^>1 s

0
<..->•

d
i

t^t
r-1

^̂
-rl
*A(d

Ml

"1

^1

^
^1^1
^1?1
d^l
nt ^1

t>JI
^

3-1

<Tl
^~»1

Q-A

^
?1

°°1

sl

01
r-1

al
-J4

s'l

0|
fil
"a

^
</>1

1(^

u
1^1

-wl^l

\r> -> ~^~->1

I
•6

I

sl
sl sl

I
§

•<*•

II
§1

10 i

a]

§1

tOl

I
§i
I

h~

I
sl
I
I
^1
I
§1
I

I

I

s
I
§

I
I

»sl
tf>l

«-1
vfi\

CM-1

tl-i

^i

Sl
il
I

I
I

I

1~>

\>

I

^
Jf
+•

\Ji

-<•

4

t^

i
k

N
<0
^

0-

-V
<_>

^
'7-

I

<b

YA-

0

3

^1

^-1
•~K

^1
^7.1

s
I
I



G
H

U
RA

 A
/E

BO
C 

RE
PO

RT
O

ct
ob

er
 8

, 2
02

1





Si
na

ja
na

 A
rt

s C
en

te
r



U
m

at
ac

 B
as

eb
al

l F
ie

ld



In
al

ah
an

 B
as

ke
tb

al
l C

ou
rt

9/
10

/2
02

1



W
om

en
’s

 T
re

at
m

en
t C

en
te

r



Si
na

jan
a F

ire
 St

ati
on

Pa
ge

 
 o

f 
1

38

G
HU

RA
 | 

11
7 

Bi
en

 V
en

id
a 

Av
en

ue
 S

in
aj

an
a,

 G
ua

m

G
ua

m
 H

ou
si

ng
 a

nd
 U

rb
an

 R
en

ew
al

 A
ut

ho
rit

y

RE
Q

U
ES

T 
FO

R 
PR

O
PO

SA
LS

 
Ar

ch
ite

ct
ur

al
/E

ng
in

ee
rin

g 
De

sig
n 

an
d 

Pr
og

ra
m

m
in

g 

Si
na

ja
na

 D
ip

at
ta

m
en

to
n 

G
uå

fi 
Si

na
ja

na
 F

ire
 S

ta
tio

n



RE
NO

VA
TIO

NS
 AN

D C
IPS

➤
A

w
ar

de
d 

Bi
ds

: 
➤

Ei
gh

t U
ni

ts
 (8

) G
um

a
Tr

an
ki

lid
at

➤
El

ev
en

 U
ni

ts
 (1

1)
 V

ar
io

us
 A

M
Ps

➤
Pu

bl
ic

 B
id

s:
➤

Pr
oc

es
si

ng
 A

dd
iti

on
al

 R
eq

ue
st

s 
(8

un
its

)
➤

D
oo

r R
ep

la
ce

m
en

ts
@

 G
H

U
RA

 1
00

➤
Le

ad
 B

as
ed

 P
ai

nt
 A

ba
te

m
en

t (
A

pr
il 

30
)

➤
O

ng
oi

ng
 M

O
D

S:
 (3

0+
 a

ct
iv

e
un

its
)

➤
A

/E
 P

ro
ce

ss
in

g 
Fi

ve
 P

ro
pe

rt
ie

s 
fo

r 
A

ffo
rd

ab
le

 H
om

es
 C

on
st

ru
ct

io
n 

Pr
oj

ec
ts

➤
U

pc
om

in
g 

A
M

P 
Pr

oj
ec

ts
:

➤
N

ew
 C

om
m

un
ity

 C
en

te
rs

–
A

M
P 

1
➤

En
vi

ro
nm

en
ta

l C
on

tr
ol

s
–

A
M

P 
4

M
O

D
S,

 C
ap

ita
l P

ro
jec

ts 
an

d o
th

er
 In

iti
ati

ve
s

❖
M

O
D

S:

❖

A
w

ar
de

d 
an

d 
In

-P
ro

gr
es

s: 
70

 ($
1.

7M
 in

 F
Y2

1)

❖

U
nd

er
 P

re
pa

ra
tio

n:
 9


❖
C

ap
ita

l P
ro

je
ct

s: 


❖
C

on
st

ru
ct

io
n:

 T
w

o 
ne

w
 H

O
M

ES
, S

ec
tio

n 
8 

Ex
pa

ns
io

n,
 D

oo
r R

ep
la

ce
m

en
t (

>$
1M

 to
ta

l)


❖
A

M
P4

 R
es

er
ve

 F
un

d:
 ($

1.
8M

)


❖
Re

po
si

tio
ni

ng
 7

50


❖
So

la
r I

ns
ta

lla
tio

n 
at

 G
T



G
H

U
RA

 A
/E

BO
C 

RE
PO

RT
 - Q

ue
sti

on
s

O
ct

ob
er

 8
, 2

02
1


